
 
 

Commission for Accessibility 

Meeting Minutes 

Monday, April 7, 2025 

 

Meeting Via Zoom  
 

In Attendance: Christine Santori, Maureen Culhane, Debbie, 

Pregor, Michael Londrigan Debra Franceschini, Divya 

Dorairrajan, Tony Phillips, Don Ciota.  

 

5:05 PM CALL TO ORDER 

 

N.B.  There was one motions made during this session. 

 

MOTION:   To approve CfA minutes from March 10, 2024 

meeting. 

  Motion by Michael, Second by Debbie 

  APPROVED UNANIMOUSLY 

 

PUBLIC COMMENT:   
 

The Chair discussed the Commission’s participation in the RPS Second 

Transition Fair on Thursday, March 13.  In attendance were Michael, 

Tony, Don and future member Divya. 

 



During public comment questions arose regarding funding for Special 

Education and grants related to special services.  Much is unknown at 

this time how the announced cuts may filter down to the local level. 

 

It was announced our two guests, Debra Franceshini and Divya 

Dorairrajan will be interviewed this Wednesday evening by the BOS 

regarding their wishes to join this commission. 

 

Commission for Accessibility 
Town of Ridgefield 

 
 
Guide to Disability Rights Laws 

This guide provides an overview of Federal civil rights laws that ensure equal 
opportunity for people with disabilities. To find out more about how these laws may 
apply to you, contact the agencies and organizations listed below. 

Americans with Disabilities Act 
(ADA) 
 

The Americans with Disabilities Act authorizes the Department of Justice (the 
Department) to provide technical assistance to individuals and entities that have rights 
or responsibilities under the Act. This document provides informal guidance to assist 
you in understanding the ADA and the Department’s regulations.\ 

The ADA prohibits discrimination on the basis of disability in employment, State and 
local government, public accommodations, commercial facilities, transportation, and 
telecommunications. It also applies to the United States Congress. 

To be protected by the ADA, one must have a disability or have a relationship or 
association with an individual with a disability. An individual with a disability is defined 
by the ADA as a person who has a physical or mental impairment that substantially 
limits one or more major life activities, a person who has a history or record of such an 
impairment, or a person who is perceived by others as having such an impairment. The 
ADA does not specifically name all of the impairments that are covered. 



ADA Title I: Employment 

Title I requires employers with 15 or more employees to provide qualified individuals 
with disabilities an equal opportunity to benefit from the full range of employment-related 
opportunities available to others. For example, it prohibits discrimination in recruitment, 
hiring, promotions, training, pay, social activities, and other privileges of employment. It 
restricts questions that can be asked about an applicant’s disability before a job offer is 
made, and it requires that employers make reasonable accommodation to the known 
physical or mental limitations of otherwise qualified individuals with disabilities, unless it 
results in undue hardship. Religious entities with 15 or more employees are covered 
under title I. 

ADA Title II: State and Local 
Government Activities 

Title II covers all activities of State and local governments regardless of the government 
entity’s size or receipt of Federal funding. Title II requires that State and local 
governments give people with disabilities an equal opportunity to benefit from all of their 
programs, services, and activities (e.g. public education, employment, transportation, 
recreation, health care, social services, courts, voting, and town meetings). 

State and local governments are required to follow specific architectural standards in 
the new construction and alteration of their buildings. They also must relocate programs 
or otherwise provide access in inaccessible older buildings, and communicate 
effectively with people who have hearing, vision, or speech disabilities. Public entities 
are not required to take actions that would result in undue financial and administrative 
burdens. They are required to make reasonable modifications to policies, practices, and 
procedures where necessary to avoid discrimination, unless they can demonstrate that 
doing so would fundamentally alter the nature of the service, program, or activity being 
provided. 

ADA Title II: Public Transportation 

The transportation provisions of title II cover public transportation services, such as city 
buses and public rail transit (e.g. subways, commuter rails, Amtrak). Public 
transportation authorities may not discriminate against people with disabilities in the 
provision of their services. They must comply with requirements for accessibility in 
newly purchased vehicles, make good faith efforts to purchase or lease accessible used 
buses, remanufacture buses in an accessible manner, and, unless it would result in an 
undue burden, provide paratransit where they operate fixed-route bus or rail systems. 
Paratransit is a service where individuals who are unable to use the regular transit 



system independently (because of a physical or mental impairment) are picked up and 
dropped off at their destinations.  

ADA Title III: Public 
Accommodations 

Title III covers businesses and nonprofit service providers that are public 
accommodations, privately operated entities offering certain types of courses and 
examinations, privately operated transportation, and commercial facilities. Public 
accommodations are private entities who own, lease, lease to, or operate facilities such 
as restaurants, retail stores, hotels, movie theaters, private schools, convention centers, 
doctors’ offices, homeless shelters, transportation depots, zoos, funeral homes, day 
care centers, and recreation facilities including sports stadiums and fitness clubs. 
Transportation services provided by private entities are also covered by title III. 

Public accommodations must comply with basic nondiscrimination requirements that 
prohibit exclusion, segregation, and unequal treatment. They also must comply with 
specific requirements related to architectural standards for new and altered buildings; 
reasonable modifications to policies, practices, and procedures; effective 
communication with people with hearing, vision, or speech disabilities; and other access 
requirements. Additionally, public accommodations must remove barriers in existing 
buildings where it is easy to do so without much difficulty or expense, given the public 
accommodation’s resources. 

ADA Title IV: Telecommunications 
Relay Services 

Title IV addresses telephone and television access for people with hearing and speech 
disabilities. It requires common carriers (telephone companies) to establish interstate 
and intrastate telecommunications relay services (TRS) 24 hours a day, 7 days a week. 
TRS enables callers with hearing and speech disabilities who use TTYs (also known as 
TDDs), and callers who use voice telephones to communicate with each other through a 
third party communications assistant. The Federal Communications Commission (FCC) 
has set minimum standards for TRS services 

Telecommunications Act 

Section 255 and Section 251(a)(2) of the Communications Act of 1934, as amended by 
the Telecommunications Act of 1996, require manufacturers of telecommunications 
equipment and providers of telecommunications services to ensure that such equipment 
and services are accessible to and usable by persons with disabilities, if readily 



achievable. These amendments ensure that people with disabilities will have access to 
a broad range of products and services such as telephones, cell phones, pagers, call-
waiting, and operator services, that were often inaccessible to many users with 
disabilities. 

Fair Housing Act 

The Fair Housing Act, as amended in 1988, prohibits housing discrimination on the 
basis of race, color, religion, sex, disability, familial status, and national origin. Its 
coverage includes private housing, housing that receives Federal financial assistance, 
and State and local government housing. It is unlawful to discriminate in any aspect of 
selling or renting housing or to deny a dwelling to a buyer or renter because of the 
disability of that individual, an individual associated with the buyer or renter, or an 
individual who intends to live in the residence. Other covered activities include, for 
example, financing, zoning practices, new construction design, and advertising. 

Air Carrier Access Act 

The Air Carrier Access Act prohibits discrimination in air transportation by domestic and 
foreign air carriers against qualified individuals with physical or mental impairments. It 
applies only to air carriers that provide regularly scheduled services for hire to the 
public. Requirements address a wide range of issues including boarding assistance and 
certain accessibility features in newly built aircraft and new or altered airport facilities.  

Voting Accessibility for the Elderly 
and Handicapped Act 

The Voting Accessibility for the Elderly and Handicapped Act of 1984 generally requires 
polling places across the United States to be physically accessible to people with 
disabilities for federal elections. Where no accessible location is available to serve as a 
polling place, a political subdivision must provide an alternate means of casting a ballot 
on the day of the election. This law also requires states to make available registration 
and voting aids for disabled and elderly voters, including information by TTYs or similar 
devices.  

Individuals with Disabilities 
Education Act 

The Individuals with Disabilities Education Act (IDEA) (formerly called P.L. 94-142 or the 
Education for all Handicapped Children Act of 1975) requires public schools to make 



available to all eligible children with disabilities a free appropriate public education in the 
least restrictive environment appropriate to their individual needs. 

IDEA requires public school systems to develop appropriate Individualized Education 
Programs (IEP’s) for each child. The specific special education and related services 
outlined in each IEP reflect the individualized needs of each student. 

IDEA also mandates that particular procedures be followed in the development of the 
IEP. Each student’s IEP must be developed by a team of knowledgeable persons and 
must be at least reviewed annually. The team includes the child’s teacher; the parents, 
subject to certain limited exceptions; the child, if determined appropriate; an agency 
representative who is qualified to provide or supervise the provision of special 
education; and other individuals at the parents’ or agency’s discretion. 

If parents disagree with the proposed IEP, they can request a due process hearing and 
a review from the State educational agency if applicable in that state. They also can 
appeal the State agency’s decision to State or Federal court.  

Rehabilitation Act 

The Rehabilitation Act prohibits discrimination on the basis of disability in programs 
conducted by Federal agencies, in programs receiving Federal financial assistance, in 
Federal employment, and in the employment practices of Federal contractors. The 
standards for determining employment discrimination under the Rehabilitation Act are 
the same as those used in title I of the Americans with Disabilities Act. 

Section 501 

Section 501 requires affirmative action and nondiscrimination in employment by Federal 
agencies of the executive branch.  

Section 503 

Section 503 requires affirmative action and prohibits employment discrimination by 
Federal government contractors and subcontractors with contracts of more than 
$10,000.  

Section 504 

Section 504 states that “no qualified individual with a disability in the United States shall 
be excluded from, denied the benefits of, or be subjected to discrimination under” any 
program or activity that either receives Federal financial assistance or is conducted by  



Section 508 

Section 508 establishes requirements for electronic and information technology 
developed, maintained, procured, or used by the Federal government. Section 508 
requires Federal electronic and information technology to be accessible to people with 
disabilities, including employees and members of the public. 

Architectural Barriers Act 

The Architectural Barriers Act (ABA) requires that buildings and facilities that are 
designed, constructed, or altered with Federal funds, or leased by a Federal agency, 
comply with Federal standards for physical accessibility. ABA requirements are limited 
to architectural standards in new and altered buildings and in newly leased facilities.  

Prepared by Don Ciota, Chairman 

Note:  This compilation has been prepared for the April 7, 2025 meeting of the 
Commission for Accessibility. 

 

6:35 PM ADJOURN 

 

2025 Meeting Dates 

 

    May 12    June 9 

July n/a   Aug n/a    Sept 8 

Oct 6   Nov 10    Dec 8 

 

*All meetings are Via Zoom on Monday of the dates above at 

5:00 PM. 

  

Minutes by Don Ciota 

 
 


